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Abstract:	 China's	 emergence	 as	 a	 global	 power	 has	 sparked	 debates	 about	 its	 role	 in	 the	
structure	of	world	peace.	This	research	addresses	the	binary	construction	of	China	as	either	a	
challenger	or	supporter	of	liberal	peace,	focusing	on	the	type	and	extent	of	its	challenges.	Using	
a	 qualitative	 methodology	 and	 case	 studies,	 this	 study	 provides	 insights	 into	 China's	
participation	 in	 the	normative	 context	 of	 liberal	 peace	and	 its	 efforts	 to	 transform	existing	
peace	 components.	 The	 research	 explores	 China's	 alternative	 approach	 to	 peacebuilding,	
grounded	 in	 the	 Five	 Principles	 of	 Peaceful	 Coexistence,	 and	 its	 implications	 for	 the	 global	
order.	 Key	 findings	 highlight	 China's	 growing	 involvement	 in	 United	 Nations	 Peacekeeping	
Operations,	its	mediation	efforts	in	conflicts	like	the	Saudi	Arabia-Iran	dispute,	and	the	use	of	
economic	cooperation	as	a	peacebuilding	tool,	demonstrating	a	significant	departure	from	the	
liberal	peace	paradigm.	
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Introduction	
The	ascension	of	China	as	a	global	

power	 has	 ignited	 a	 vigorous	 debate	
regarding	 its	 role	 in	 the	 framework	 of	
international	 peace.	 Traditionally,	 global	
peacebuilding	 efforts	 have	 been	
dominated	by	the	liberal	peace	paradigm,	
which	 emphasizes	 the	 promotion	 of	
human	 rights,	 institutional	 reforms,	 and	
liberal	 economic	 models	 as	 essential	
pathways	to	achieving	sustainable	peace.	
This	approach,	deeply	rooted	in	Western	
ideologies,	has	been	influential	in	shaping	
post-conflict	 reconstruction	 and	
development	 policies	 worldwide.	
However,	 China's	 emergence	 offers	 a	
unique	and	compelling	alternative,	posing	
a	significant	challenge	to	the	hegemony	of	
the	liberal	peace	framework.	

China's	 involvement	 in	 global	
peacebuilding	is	multifaceted	and	reflects	
its	growing	influence	on	the	international	
stage.	 Since	 its	 first	 engagement	 with	
United	Nations	Peacekeeping	Operations	
(UNPKO)	 in	 1989,	 when	 it	 joined	 the	
United	 Nations	 Transition	 Assistance	
Group	 (UNTAG)	 in	 Namibia,	 China	 has	
substantially	increased	its	participation	in	
peacekeeping	missions	(Popovic	&	Stevic,	
2021).	 By	 2020,	 China	 had	 become	 the	
tenth-largest	 provider	 of	 peacekeeping	
troops,	 contributing	 2,249	 peacekeepers	
to	 25	 UNPKO	 missions,	 surpassing	 the	
total	 contributions	 of	 other	 permanent	
members	 of	 the	United	Nations	 Security	
Council.	China's	financial	contributions	to	
UN	 peacekeeping	 have	 also	 grown	
significantly,	making	it	the	second-largest	
donor	 after	 the	 United	 States	 for	 the	
2020-2021	 period,	 covering	 15.21%	 of	
the	 total	 peacekeeping	 budget	 (United	
Nations	Peacekeeping,	2024).	

Beyond	 its	 involvement	 in	
peacekeeping,	 China	 has	 engaged	 in	
conflict	 mediation	 and	 post-conflict	
reconstruction,	 especially	 under	 the	

leadership	 of	 President	 Xi	 Jinping,	 who	
has	 emphasized	 "major	 country	
diplomacy	with	 Chinese	 characteristics."	
A	 notable	 example	 is	 China's	 role	 as	 a	
mediator	 in	 the	 Saudi-Iran	 conflict.	
China's	 facilitation	 of	 the	 restoration	 of	
diplomatic	 relations	 between	 Saudi	
Arabia	 and	 Iran	 in	 March	 2023	
exemplifies	 its	 application	 of	 the	 Five	
Principles	 of	 Peaceful	 Coexistence:	
mutual	 respect	 for	 sovereignty	 and	
territorial	 integrity,	 mutual	 non-
aggression,	 non-interference	 in	 each	
other's	 internal	 affairs,	 equality	 and	
mutual	benefit,	and	peaceful	coexistence.	
These	 principles,	 first	 articulated	 in	 the	
1950s	during	negotiations	with	India	and	
Burma,	 have	 become	 a	 cornerstone	 of	
China's	 foreign	 policy	 and	 a	 guiding	
framework	 for	 its	 peacebuilding	
initiatives	(Chen	et	al.,	2023).	

China's	 economic	 rise	has	 further	
bolstered	 its	 capacity	 to	 influence	global	
peacebuilding.	 The	 Belt	 and	 Road	
Initiative	 (BRI),	 launched	 in	 2013,	 is	 a	
flagship	 economic	 strategy	 that	 aims	 to	
enhance	 global	 connectivity	 through	
infrastructure	development	and	trade.	By	
investing	in	infrastructure	projects	across	
Asia,	 Africa,	 and	 Latin	 America,	 China	
seeks	 to	 promote	 economic	 growth	 and	
stability	 in	conflict-affected	regions.	This	
approach	 aligns	 with	 China's	 belief	 that	
economic	development	is	foundational	to	
achieving	 long-term	 peace	 and	 stability.	
The	 China-United	 Nations	 Peace	 and	
Development	 Trust	 Fund	 (UNPDF),	
established	 in	 2016,	 exemplifies	 China's	
commitment	 to	 integrating	 economic	
cooperation	 with	 peacebuilding	 efforts	
(Menegazzi,	2012).	

China's	 alternative	 approach	 to	
peacebuilding,	 which	 prioritizes	
economic	 cooperation	 and	 non-
interference,	 stands	 in	 stark	 contrast	 to	
the	 liberal	 peace	 paradigm.	 The	 liberal	
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peace	 model,	 often	 criticized	 for	 its	
coercive	 methods	 and	 imposition	 of	
Western	 norms,	 focuses	 on	
democratization,	 human	 rights,	 and	
economic	 liberalization	 as	 prerequisites	
for	 peace.	 In	 contrast,	 China's	 approach	
respects	 the	 sovereignty	 of	 nations	 and	
promotes	stability	through	mutual	benefit	
and	 economic	 development	 (Stimson,	
2023).	 This	 divergence	 in	 strategies	 has	
significant	 implications	 for	 the	 global	
order,	 suggesting	 the	 emergence	 of	 a	
multipolar	 world	 where	 diverse	
peacebuilding	models	coexist	(VOA	News,	
2023).	

From	a	global	perspective,	China’s	
initiative	 may	 also	 be	 interpreted	 as	 a	
strategic	endeavor	to	secure	its	long-term	
economic	 interests.	 Protracted	 conflicts	
and	 wars	 often	 result	 in	 humanitarian	
crises	 and	 economic	 disruptions.	 In	
response,	 China	 seeks	 to	 promote	
stability	 through	 peace-building	 efforts,	
thereby	 creating	 a	 conducive	
environment	 for	 sustained	 economic	
cooperation.	 Such	 stability	 is	 viewed	 as	
essential	 to	 advancing	 China’s	 broader	
national	vision	of	becoming	a	prosperous	
and	 fully	developed	nation	by	2049.	The	
realization	 of	 this	 ambition	 hinges	 on	
China’s	 capacity	 to	 maintain	 steady	
economic	 growth	 and	 to	 elevate	 its	 per	
capita	 income	 to	 levels	 commensurate	
with	those	of	advanced	economies.	

The	 dichotomy	 between	 liberal	
peace	 and	 China's	 Five	 Principles	 of	
Peaceful	 Coexistence	 forms	 the	
theoretical	 foundation	 of	 this	 research.	
While	 liberal	 peacebuilding	 emphasizes	
human	 rights	 and	 institutional	 reform,	
China's	 model	 advocates	 for	 a	
harmonious	coexistence	without	external	
political	 imposition.	 This	 research	
employs	 a	 qualitative	 methodology,	
utilizing	 case	 studies	 to	 examine	China's	
peacebuilding	 efforts,	 particularly	 in	 the	

Saudi-Iran	 mediation	 and	 its	 broader	
peacebuilding	activities.	

Many	 academics	 have	 divided	
previous	 research	 on	 China's	 efforts	 to	
build	peace	into	two	main	categories.	The	
first	category	focuses	on	China's	efforts	to	
build	peace	in	the	world	by	applying	the	
principles	to	which	it	adheres.	Kuo	(2015)	
identifies	increased	Chinese	participation	
in	 post-Cold	 War	 African	 peace	
operations.	China	is	not	a	major	player	in	
this	 peace,	 but	 it	 challenges	 Western	
dominance.	 This	 article	 elucidates	 the	
distinctions,	 conflicts,	 and	 synergies	
between	 the	 dominant	 liberal	 approach	
and	 the	 emerging	 Chinese	 strategy	 for	
peacebuilding.	 Yuan	 (2020)	 emphasized	
China's	 growing	 engagement	 in	 conflict	
management	 and	 post-conflict	
reconstruction,	 particularly	 in	 Southeast	
Asia	and	sub-Saharan	Africa,	with	the	aim	
of	 promoting	 peace	 and	 development.	
This	 research	 contends	 that	 a	
comprehensive	understanding	of	China's	
national	 history	 in	 development	 shapes	
the	 selective	 reinforcement	 of	 Chinese	
historical	 history	 and	 practices	 in	 peace	
and	security.	

Later,	 findings	 from	 Adhikari	
(2021)	discuss	how	China	is	in	the	context	
of	 the	 decline	 of	 the	Western-led	 liberal	
world	 order	 through	 involvement	 in	
Myanmar.	 First,	 this	 article	 outlines	
China's	 approach	 to	 peacebuilding,	
emphasizing	five	key	elements:	a	focus	on	
stability,	 a	 focus	 on	 development	
priorities,	a	limited	adherence	to	national	
interests,	 the	role	of	regional	actors,	and	
the	 avoidance	 of	 raw	 policy	 positions.	
Second,	the	article	elucidates	how	Chinese	
involvement	in	peace-building	can	lead	to	
tensions	 between	 these	 elements,	
disregard	 local	 needs,	 reinforce	 elite	
control	over	the	country,	and	overlook	the	
political	 context	 in	 the	 peace	 process,	 a	
stance	 that	 mirrors	 criticism	 of	 liberal	
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peace-building	 initiatives.	 Lei	 (2011)	
conducted	a	study	on	the	two	key	pillars	
of	the	Chinese	approach	to	peacebuilding.	
China	is	more	cautious	in	contributing	to	
the	IPBO	because	it	gives	more	priority	to	
development	and	understanding	of	peace	
development,	 whereas	 Western	 nations	
have	 suspicions	 about	 China's	 growing	
strength	 and	 intentions.	 Zhang	 (2022)	
shows	 that	 China	 emphasizes	 the	
importance	 of	 a	 peaceful	 environment	
and	 long-term	 cooperation	 without	 the	
intention	 of	 overthrowing	 the	 existing	
international	 system.	 This	 article	 also	
looks	 at	 the	 current	 China-United	 States	
relationship	 in	 a	 sensitive	 phase	 and	
requires	 a	 wise	 new	 approach.	 People	
view	 China's	 rise	 as	 a	 significant	 event	
that	 alters	 global	 dynamics	 and	
necessitates	 effective	 management	 for	 a	
peaceful	era.	

The	 second	 category	 relates	 to	
China's	 efforts	 to	 build	 civil	 society	
through	economic	cooperation.	According	
to	 Lyall	 et	 al.	 (2023),	 China's	 active	
involvement	in	peacebuilding	stems	from	
its	 status	 as	 a	 major	 power	 and	 its	
geostrategic	 security	 interests.	 China	 is	
actively	enhancing	its	role	and	identity	in	
the	 international	 arena	by	 leveraging	 its	
economic	 involvement	 in	 peacebuilding	
efforts.	 Wong	 (2021)	 presents	 China's	
new	 approach	 to	 "peacebuilding."	 This	
approach	 emphasizes	 economic	
development	 as	 a	 top	 priority	 in	
developing	 countries	 in	 Asia	 and	 Africa.	
This	 raises	 the	 question	 of	 whether	
focusing	on	economic	development	alone	
can	 create	 lasting	 peace	 in	 post-conflict	
societies.	 Moreover,	 this	 article	 reveals	
that	the	Chinese	peace	process	is	defying	
the	 Western-dominated	 norms	 of	
peacebuilding.	 Qayum	 et	 al.	 (2018)	
examined	China's	active	facilitation	of	the	
reconciliation	 process	 and	 efforts	 to	
strengthen	 the	 trilateral	 relationship	

between	 the	 Taliban	 and	 the	 Afghan	
government,	 highlighted	 China's	 role	 in	
supporting	reconciliations	in	Afghanistan,	
and	 then	 evaluated	 China's	 contribution	
to	 infrastructure	 development	 in	
Afghanistan.	

Research	 on	 China's	 efforts	 in	
"peacebuilding"	 or	 mediation	 has	 been	
extensive,	yet	it	typically	concentrates	on	
two	primary	aspects.	Firstly,	the	research	
primarily	 focuses	 on	 China's	 efforts	 to	
promote	 global	 peace	 through	 the	
principles	it	upholds.	Secondly,	this	article	
focuses	on	China's	efforts	to	foster	peace	
through	 economic	 cooperation.	 By	
reviewing	 and	 analyzing	 how	 many	
conflicting	 nations	 can	 accept	 China's	
great	 ambition	 to	 promote	 peace	 efforts	
based	on	the	"Five	Principles	of	Peaceful	
Coexistence,"	 this	 article	 seeks	 to	bridge	
the	gaps	in	existing	research.	

The	 theoretical	 foundation	of	 this	
research	 contrasts	 the	 liberal	
peacebuilding	 model	 with	 China's	 Five	
Principles	 of	 Peaceful	 Coexistence,	
exploring	 their	 implications	 for	 global	
conflict	 resolution.	 The	 liberal	 peace	
model,	 deeply	 rooted	 in	 Western	
ideologies,	 emphasizes	 human	 rights,	
institutional	 reform,	 and	 economic	
liberalization	 as	 the	 core	 elements	
necessary	 for	 achieving	 and	maintaining	
peace.	

Human	rights	are	a	central	pillar	of	
the	 liberal	 peace	 model,	 which	 places	
significant	 emphasis	 on	 the	 protection	
and	 promotion	 of	 individual	 rights	 and	
freedoms.	 This	 model	 advocates	 for	
universal	 human	 rights,	 including	 civil	
liberties,	 political	 rights,	 and	 social	 and	
economic	 rights,	 as	 fundamental	 to	
peacebuilding.	 Efforts	 within	 this	
framework	 often	 involve	 international	
interventions	 and	 policies	 aimed	 at	
ensuring	that	human	rights	are	upheld	in	
post-conflict	 societies.	 Such	 initiatives	
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underscore	 the	 belief	 that	 peace	 is	
sustainable	only	when	individuals'	rights	
are	 protected	 and	 respected	 (Avi-Guy,	
2021).	

Institutional	 reform	 is	 another	
cornerstone	 of	 the	 liberal	 peace	 model,	
focusing	 on	 the	 establishment	 of	
democratic	 governance	 structures	 and	
transparent	 institutions.	 This	 principle	
supports	 the	 creation	 of	 democratic	
political	 systems,	 the	 rule	 of	 law,	 and	
accountable	 governance	 as	 essential	 for	
sustaining	 peace.	 The	 emphasis	 is	 on	
building	 institutions	 that	 can	 provide	
stability,	 security,	 and	 justice,	 thereby	
preventing	 the	 recurrence	 of	 conflict.	
Democratic	 reforms	are	 seen	as	vital	 for	
fostering	 political	 inclusivity	 and	
reducing	 the	 likelihood	 of	
authoritarianism	and	 corruption	 (Visoka	
&	Richmond,	2016).	

Economic	 liberalization	 is	
promoted	 as	 a	 basis	 for	 peace	 and	
development	 within	 the	 liberal	 peace	
framework.	 This	 approach	 argues	 that	
economic	 interdependence	 and	 market	
liberalization	can	foster	peace	by	creating	
mutual	 benefits	 and	 reducing	 incentives	
for	 conflict.	 Policies	 such	 as	 reducing	
trade	 barriers,	 encouraging	 foreign	
investment,	 and	 privatizing	 state-owned	
enterprises	 are	 advocated	 to	 stimulate	
economic	 growth	 and	 integration.	 The	
belief	 is	 that	 economic	 prosperity	 and	
interconnectedness	 through	 free-market	
economies	 can	 mitigate	 the	 underlying	
economic	 causes	 of	 conflict	 and	
contribute	to	long-term	stability	(Miklian,	
2014).	

In	 contrast,	 China’s	 approach	 to	
peacebuilding	 is	 grounded	 in	 the	 Five	
Principles	of	Peaceful	Coexistence,	which	
offer	 an	 alternative	 paradigm	
emphasizing	 sovereignty,	 non-
interference,	 and	mutual	 benefit.	Mutual	
respect	 for	 sovereignty	 and	 territorial	

integrity	is	a	foundational	tenet	of	China's	
foreign	policy,	advocating	for	the	respect	
of	 nations'	 independence	 and	 their	
territorial	 boundaries.	 This	 principle	
upholds	 the	 notion	 that	 all	 countries,	
regardless	of	size	or	power,	should	have	
their	 sovereignty	 respected	 and	 be	 free	
from	 external	 interference	 (Ministry	 of	
Foreign	Affairs	of	the	People’s	Republic	of	
China,	2014).	

Mutual	 non-aggression	 is	 another	
critical	 component	 of	 China’s	 approach,	
emphasizing	 the	 avoidance	 of	 the	use	 of	
force	or	the	threat	of	force	in	international	
relations.	 This	 principle	 aligns	 with	
China's	broader	commitment	 to	peaceful	
dispute	 resolution	 and	 its	 opposition	 to	
military	 interventions.	By	advocating	 for	
non-aggression,	China	promotes	a	 stable	
international	 environment	 where	
conflicts	 are	 resolved	 through	 dialogue	
rather	 than	 coercion	 (Theory	 China,	
2021).	

Non-interference	 in	 each	 other’s	
internal	 affairs	 reflects	 China’s	 stance	
against	 foreign	 interference	 in	 domestic	
matters.	 This	 principle	 emphasizes	
respecting	 the	 internal	 policies	 and	
governance	 of	 other	 nations,	 thereby	
promoting	 a	 policy	 of	 non-intervention.	
China's	 approach	 advocates	 for	 allowing	
countries	to	manage	their	internal	affairs	
without	 external	 pressure	 or	 influence,	
thereby	 fostering	 respect	 for	 national	
sovereignty	 and	 self-determination	 (Jiali	
&	Thakur,	2004).	

Equality	 and	 mutual	 benefit	
underpin	 China's	 international	 relations	
strategy,	 promoting	 cooperation	 that	
benefits	all	parties	involved	equally.	This	
principle	 advocates	 for	 mutually	
beneficial	 economic	 and	 political	
partnerships,	 emphasizing	 equitable	
gains	and	shared	prosperity.	China’s	focus	
on	mutual	benefit	seeks	to	create	win-win	
situations	 in	 its	 international	
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engagements,	ensuring	that	partnerships	
are	 fair	 and	 contribute	 to	 the	
development	and	stability	of	all	 involved	
countries	(Marks,	2024).	

Peaceful	 coexistence	 is	 the	
overarching	 goal	 of	 China’s	 Five	
Principles,	aiming	to	foster	a	harmonious	
international	 environment	 where	
countries	 can	 coexist	 peacefully	 and	
collaborate	 on	 global	 issues.	 This	
principle	encourages	nations	to	engage	in	
cooperative	 and	 peaceful	 relations,	
focusing	on	common	interests	and	shared	
goals.	By	promoting	peaceful	coexistence,	
China	seeks	to	build	a	world	order	based	
on	 respect,	 stability,	 and	 cooperative	
development	(Haiyun,	2023).	

These	 principles	 have	 been	
integral	 to	 China’s	 foreign	 policy	 since	
their	introduction	in	the	1950s	and	serve	
as	 the	 basis	 for	 its	 peacebuilding	
initiatives.	 Unlike	 the	 Western	 liberal	
peace	 paradigm,	 which	 often	 involves	
direct	intervention	and	the	imposition	of	
political	 and	 economic	 reforms,	 China’s	
approach	is	characterized	by	a	respect	for	
sovereignty,	 non-interference,	 and	 the	
pursuit	 of	 mutually	 beneficial	
cooperation.	 This	 research	 framework	
will	 be	 used	 to	 analyze	 China’s	
peacebuilding	 efforts	 through	 detailed	
case	 studies,	 such	 as	 its	 role	 in	 United	
Nations	 Peacekeeping	 Operations	
(UNPKO)	and	mediation	in	the	Saudi-Iran	
conflict.	The	framework	will	also	explore	
how	China’s	economic	initiatives,	like	the	
Belt	and	Road	Initiative	(BRI),	contribute	
to	 its	 peacebuilding	 strategy.	 By	
examining	 these	 aspects,	 the	 study	 aims	
to	 provide	 a	 comprehensive	
understanding	 of	 how	 China’s	 approach	
to	global	conflict	resolution	diverges	from	
the	 liberal	peace	model	and	 its	potential	
implications	for	the	global	order.	
	 Accordingly,	 China’s	 efforts	 to	
foster	 political	 stability	 through	

diplomatic	 negotiations	 and	 peace-
oriented	initiatives	constitute	an	integral	
component	 of	 its	 broader	 strategic	
agenda	 to	 establish	 favorable	
preconditions	 for	 long-term	 economic	
cooperation	with	strategic	partner	states.	
Political	 stability	 is	 perceived	 as	 a	 vital	
mechanism	 for	mitigating	 the	 disruptive	
consequences	 of	 conflict,	 thereby	
enabling	 post-conflict	 countries	 to	
meaningfully	engage	 in	and	benefit	 from	
the	implementation	of	the	Belt	and	Road	
Initiative	(BRI).	This	strategic	orientation	
reflects	China’s	overarching	foreign	policy	
objectives	 of	 safeguarding	 economic	
access	 and	 promoting	 regional	
development,	 underscoring	 the	
interdependent	 relationship	 between	
peace	 and	 economic	 prosperity	 as	
mutually	 reinforcing	 pillars	 of	 its	
international	engagement.	
	
Method	

This	 research	 employs	 a	
qualitative	 methodology	 to	 explore	
China's	 alternative	 approach	 to	 global	
conflict	 resolution,	 focusing	 on	 its	
peacebuilding	strategies	grounded	in	the	
Five	Principles	of	Peaceful	Coexistence.	A	
case	study	approach	is	adopted	to	provide	
an	in-depth	analysis	of	specific	 instances	
where	China's	peacebuilding	efforts	have	
been	 implemented,	 such	 as	 its	 role	 in	
United	Nations	Peacekeeping	Operations	
(UNPKO)	and	its	mediation	 in	the	Saudi-
Iran	 conflict.	 This	 approach	 allows	 for	 a	
comprehensive	 understanding	 of	 the	
nuances	 and	 effectiveness	 of	 China's	
strategies	in	different	contexts.	

Data	for	this	research	is	collected	
from	both	primary	and	secondary	sources	
to	 ensure	 a	 robust	 and	 comprehensive	
analysis.	 Primary	 data	 is	 sourced	 from	
official	 documents	 and	 statements	 from	
the	Ministry	 of	 Foreign	 Affairs	 of	 China.	
These	documents	provide	direct	 insights	
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into	 China's	 foreign	 policy	 and	
peacebuilding	 initiatives,	allowing	 for	an	
authentic	 representation	 of	 China's	
strategic	intentions	and	actions	(Ministry	
of	Foreign	Affairs	of	the	People’s	Republic	
of	 China,	 2014).	 Secondary	 data	 is	
gathered	 from	a	wide	 range	of	 scholarly	
articles,	 books,	 and	 reports	 from	
reputable	 research	 institutions	 such	 as	
the	Center	for	Strategic	and	International	
Studies	 (CSIS)	 and	 the	 Middle	 East	
Institute.	 These	 sources	 provide	 critical	
analyses	and	contextual	information	that	
complement	 the	primary	data,	offering	a	
broader	 perspective	 on	 China's	
peacebuilding	efforts.	Additionally,	online	
sources	 such	 as	 articles	 from	 The	
Diplomat,	 The	 Conversation,	 and	 The	
Atlantic	 are	 utilized	 to	 incorporate	
current	and	diverse	viewpoints	on	China's	
role	in	global	conflict	resolution	(Burton,	
2023;	Marks,	2024).	

The	 case	 study	 approach	 is	
chosen	 for	 its	 ability	 to	provide	detailed	
and	 context-rich	 analysis.	 This	 research	
focuses	on	two	main	case	studies:	China’s	
participation	in	UNPKO	and	its	mediation	
efforts	 in	 the	 Saudi-Iran	 conflict.	 These	
cases	are	selected	due	to	their	significance	
in	 illustrating	 China's	 application	 of	 the	
Five	 Principles	 of	 Peaceful	 Coexistence	
and	 their	 impact	 on	 international	
peacebuilding.	 The	 case	 study	 of	 China’s	
role	 in	 United	 Nations	 Peacekeeping	
Operations	 examines	 China’s	 increasing	
involvement	 in	 UNPKO,	 highlighting	 its	
contributions	 to	 various	 missions	
worldwide.	 It	 explores	 how	 China’s	
participation	aligns	with	 its	principles	of	
non-interference,	 mutual	 respect,	 and	
peaceful	 coexistence.	 The	 analysis	
includes	China's	historical	involvement	in	
missions	 such	 as	 the	 United	 Nations	
Transition	Assistance	Group	 (UNTAG)	 in	
Namibia	 and	 its	 more	 recent	 roles	 in	
peacekeeping	 operations	 (Gill	 &	 Huang,	

2009).	The	case	study	focusing	on	China’s	
mediation	 in	 the	 Saudi-Iran	 conflict	
showcases	its	role	as	a	neutral	facilitator	
in	 conflict	 resolution.	 It	 examines	 the	
strategies	 employed	 by	 China	 to	 foster	
dialogue	and	reconciliation,	emphasizing	
its	 adherence	 to	 the	 principles	 of	 non-
aggression,	 equality,	 and	mutual	 benefit.	
The	study	assesses	the	outcomes	of	these	
mediation	 efforts	 and	 their	 implications	
for	 regional	 stability	 and	 global	 peace	
(Stimson,	2023;	VOA	News,	2023).	

The	 data	 analysis	 involves	 a	
systematic	 examination	 of	 the	 collected	
data	 through	 thematic	 and	 comparative	
analysis.	 Thematic	 analysis	 is	 used	 to	
identify	 and	 analyze	 patterns	 related	 to	
China’s	peacebuilding	strategies	and	their	
implementation.	This	involves	coding	the	
data	 into	 themes	 such	 as	 “non-
interference,”	 “mutual	 benefit,”	 and	
“peaceful	 coexistence,”	 which	 are	 then	
analyzed	to	understand	their	application	
and	 impact	 in	 the	 selected	 case	 studies	
(Braun	 &	 Clarke,	 2006).	 Comparative	
analysis	 is	conducted	 to	contrast	China’s	
approach	 with	 the	 liberal	 peace	 model.	
This	 involves	 examining	 the	 differences	
and	 similarities	 in	 the	 principles,	
methods,	 and	 outcomes	 of	 the	 two	
approaches.	 By	 comparing	 these	
frameworks,	 the	 study	 aims	 to	 highlight	
the	 unique	 aspects	 of	 China’s	
peacebuilding	 strategy	 and	 its	 potential	
advantages	and	limitations	in	the	context	
of	 global	 conflict	 resolution	 (Visoka	 &	
Richmond,	2016).	

The	 qualitative	 approach,	
particularly	 the	 case	 study	 method,	 is	
selected	due	to	its	strength	in	uncovering	
the	complexities	behind	China's	strategic	
behavior	 in	 international	 peacebuilding.	
This	 method	 allows	 the	 research	 to	
operate	 on	 a	 deeper	 level	 of	 inquiry,	
focusing	 not	 only	 on	what	 actions	 China	
has	taken,	but	also	on	how	and	why	these	
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actions	 are	 framed	 within	 its	 broader	
foreign	 policy	 agenda.	 By	 analyzing	
contextual	 evidence	 and	 thematic	
patterns,	 the	study	 is	able	 to	construct	a	
grounded	 understanding	 of	 China's	
operational	 logic	 and	normative	 framing	
of	global	conflict	resolution.	

To	 ensure	 the	 validity	 and	
reliability	 of	 the	 research	 findings,	
multiple	 data	 sources	 are	 triangulated.	
This	 involves	 cross-referencing	
information	 from	 primary	 documents,	
secondary	 literature,	 and	 online	 sources	
to	 confirm	 the	 accuracy	 and	 consistency	
of	 the	 data.	 Additionally,	 the	 case	 study	
approach	 allows	 for	 an	 in-depth	
examination	 of	 specific	 instances,	
providing	a	detailed	and	context-specific	
understanding	 of	 China's	 peacebuilding	
efforts	(Yin,	2018).	Ethical	considerations	
are	paramount	in	this	research.	The	study	
adheres	to	ethical	guidelines	by	ensuring	
the	 confidentiality	 and	 integrity	 of	 the	
data.	 All	 sources	 are	 appropriately	 cited	
to	 give	 credit	 to	 original	 authors	 and	 to	
maintain	 academic	 integrity.	 Moreover,	
the	 research	 avoids	 any	 form	 of	 bias	 by	
presenting	 balanced	 and	 evidence-based	
analyses	 of	 China’s	 peacebuilding	
strategies.	

This	research	method	framework	
will	 be	 used	 to	 analyze	 the	 study	
investigated,	 providing	 a	 comprehensive	
and	 nuanced	 understanding	 of	 China's	
approach	to	global	conflict	resolution.	By	
employing	a	qualitative	methodology	and	
case	study	approach,	the	research	aims	to	
contribute	 valuable	 insights	 into	 the	
effectiveness	 and	 implications	of	 China's	
peacebuilding	efforts	in	the	international	
arena.	
	
Result	and	Analysis	
China’s	Real	Commitments	to	Peaceful	
Coexistence	

China's	 critique	 of	 U.S.-led	 peace	
efforts	highlights	the	inconsistencies	and	
double	standards	inherent	in	the	practice	
of	 liberal	peace,	a	model	 championed	by	
the	 United	 States.	 The	 liberal	 peace	
framework	 promotes	 democracy,	 free	
markets,	 and	 liberal	 institutions	 as	
prerequisites	 for	 peace;	 however,	 this	
study	 finds	 that	 such	 efforts	 are	 often	
accompanied	 by	 military	 interventions,	
regime	 change	 agendas,	 and	 a	 selective	
alignment	 with	 actors	 that	 serve	 U.S.	
strategic	 interests.	Rather	than	resolving	
conflicts,	 these	 practices	 frequently	
exacerbate	 them,	 as	 evidenced	 in	 the	
cases	 of	 Ukraine	 and	 Israel's	 military	
operations	 in	 Gaza,	 where	 the	 U.S.	 has	
supported	one	side	while	simultaneously	
presenting	 itself	 as	 a	 neutral	 mediator.	
These	 findings	 suggest	 that	 American	
peacebuilding	initiatives	are	driven	more	
by	 geopolitical	 calculations	 than	 by	 a	
genuine	 commitment	 to	 justice	 and	
stability.	

In	 response	 to	 the	 dominance	 of	
the	 liberal	 peace	 model,	 China	 has	
developed	 an	 alternative	 approach	
grounded	in	non-intervention,	respect	for	
national	 sovereignty,	 and	 multilateral	
dialogue	 based	 on	 equality.	 This	 is	
embodied	 in	 concepts	 such	 as	 “mutual	
coexistence”	 and	 “common	 security,”	
which	 reject	 the	 assumption	 that	 liberal	
democracy	is	the	sole	path	to	peace.	The	
analysis	 indicates	 that	 China	 positions	
itself	 as	 a	 global	 actor	 offering	 conflict	
resolution	strategies	that	emphasize	local	
consensus,	 domestic	 stability,	 and	
ideological	 neutrality.	 Thus,	 China	 not	
only	challenges	the	normative	legitimacy	
of	 Western-led	 liberal	 peace	 but	 also	
articulates	 a	 counter-narrative	 that	
promotes	 a	 more	 inclusive	 and	 context-
sensitive	 framework	 for	 addressing	
international	conflicts.	
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China’s	 Role	 in	 United	 Nations	
Peacekeeping	Operations	(UNPKO)	

China	 has	 significantly	 increased	
its	 participation	 in	UNPKO	 since	 its	 first	
mission	 in	 1989,	 becoming	 one	 of	 the	
largest	 contributors	 of	 personnel	 and	
financial	 resources.	 Since	 the	 1990s,	
China	has	officially	sent	more	than	40,000	
troops	to	25	United	Nations	peacekeeping	
missions	 around	 the	 world.	 This	 makes	
China	the	second-largest	country	in	terms	
of	 the	number	of	 troops	deployed	 to	UN	
peace	 operations,	 after	 countries	 like	
Bangladesh	 and	 India.	 In	 this	 situation,	
China	 has	 demonstrated	 its	 strong	
commitment	to	world	peace	and	stability,	
as	well	as	its	desire	to	participate	actively	
in	the	resolution	of	international	conflicts.	
China,	as	a	permanent	member	of	the	UN	
Security	 Council,	 has	 a	 greater	
responsibility	 to	 ensure	 that	 UN	
operations	are	running	smoothly	and	the	
peace	 mission	 continues.	 Furthermore,	
China	contributes	significantly	in	terms	of	
funding	to	UN	operational	costs,	including	
peacekeeping	 missions.	 China	 is	 the	
second	 largest	 donor	 after	 the	 United	
States	for	the	UN	peacekeeping	budget	for	
2020-2021,	with	a	contribution	of	15.21%	
of	the	total	budget,	while	the	US	stands	at	
the	top	with	a	contribution	of	28%	(Arrey,	
2023).	

China's	 participation	 in	UNPKO	 is	
not	 only	 due	 to	 the	 number	 of	 military	
personnel	 deployed	 but	 also	 because	 of	
their	commitment	to	the	United	Nations'	
principles	of	peace.	For	example,	China	is	
frequently	 involved	 in	 UNPKO's	
sustainable	 peace-building	 missions,	
including	 ceasefire	 surveillance,	
humanitarian	 aid,	 election	 monitoring,	
and	 local	 capacity	 building	(Xinhua,	
2020).	

China	 has	 a	 model	 of	 peace	 that	
prioritizes	 social	 stability	 and	 economic	
development	 over	 political	 reforms	 and	

individual	rights,	based	on	China's	lack	of	
interference	 in	 other	 countries'	 internal	
affairs.	 China	 adopted	 peacebuilding,	
which	 includes	 infrastructure	
rehabilitation,	 economic	 revitalization,	
peace	 and	 security,	 and	 strengthening	
government	 and	 the	 rule	 of	 law.	 In	 this	
case,	 China	 contributes	 to	 infrastructure	
funding	 and	 economic	 revitalization	 as	
part	 of	 its	 strategy,	 but	 it	 does	 not	
contribute	 to	 the	 country's	 rule	 of	 law	
project	(Kuo,	2020).	

This	 involvement	 underscores	
China’s	 commitment	 to	 multilateralism	
and	global	stability.	Examples	include	its	
contributions:	 China	 sent	 20	 military	
personnel	 to	 the	 United	 Nations	
Transition	Assistance	Group	 (UNTAG)	 in	
Namibia	and	various	missions	worldwide	
in	 1989.	 China's	 participation	 in	 the	
UNTAG	 came	 during	 a	 period	 of	 major	
changes	 in	 China's	 foreign	 policy	 under	
Deng	 Xiaoping.	 At	 that	 time,	 China	 was	
undergoing	 a	 transition	 from	 a	 more	
closed	 domestic	 focus	 to	 a	 more	 open	
focus	 on	 a	 larger	 international	 role.	 The	
principle	 of	 non-interference	 in	 the	
internal	affairs	of	other	countries	remains	
an	important	guideline	in	China's	foreign	
policy,	 but	 participation	 in	 UN	 peace	
missions	shows	that	China	is	beginning	to	
consider	a	more	active	global	role	(Gill	&	
Huang,	2009).	

After	 the	 UNTAG	 mission,	 China	
has	 sent	 five	 military	 observers	 to	 the	
Middle	 East	 to	 assist	 the	United	Nations	
Truce	Supervision	Organization	(UNTSO).	
Although	 these	 contributions	 are	
relatively	small,	the	move	reflects	China's	
commitment	 to	 supporting	 international	
peace	efforts	in	different	regions.	In	1993,	
China	also	sent	its	first	military	troops	to	
Cambodia.	 For	 18	 months,	 a	 United	
Nations	 peacekeeping	 mission	 in	
Cambodia	deployed	this	force,	comprising	
400	 technical	 troops	 and	 49	 military	
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observers.	 It	 is	 one	 of	 the	 earliest	
examples	of	China's	direct	involvement	in	
more	 substantial	 peacekeeping	
operations,	marking	the	further	evolution	
of	 their	 foreign	 policy	 towards	 more	
international	 engagement	 (The	 State	
Council	 Information	 Office,	 The	 People's	
Republic	 of	 China,	 2020).	 China's	
increasing	 role	 in	 peacekeeping	
operations	showcases	its	proactive	stance	
in	 maintaining	 global	 peace,	
demonstrating	a	commitment	not	 just	 to	
rhetoric	 but	 to	 tangible	 actions	 that	
support	international	stability.	
	
Mediation	 Efforts:	 The	 Saudi-Iran	
Conflict	

	China’s	 role	 as	 a	 mediator	 in	 the	
Saudi-Iran	 conflict	 exemplifies	 its	
application	 of	 the	 Five	 Principles	 of	
Peaceful	 Coexistence.	 By	 facilitating	
dialogue	 and	 reopening	 diplomatic	
relations,	 China	 has	 demonstrated	 its	
commitment	 to	 non-interference	 and	
mutual	 respect.	 First,	 China	 promotes	
mutual	 respect	 for	 national	 sovereignty	
and	territorial	integrity	by	demonstrating	
its	commitment	to	regional	neutrality	and	
peace,	 as	 outlined	 in	 official	 guidelines	
such	as	China	and	the	World	 in	 the	New	
Era,	China-Arab	Policy	Paper,	and	China's	
International	 Development	 Cooperation	
in	the	New	Era	(Marks,	2024).	

Second,	 China's	 approach	 to	 Iran-
Saudi	Arabia	peace	efforts	is	based	on	the	
principle	 of	 non-aggression.	 With	 this	
policy,	 China	 seeks	 to	 prevent	 conflict	
escalation	and	promote	regional	stability	
amid	the	unstable	situation	in	the	Middle	
East.	 China	 strictly	 avoids	 military	
intervention	and	does	not	support	acts	of	
aggression	 from	 either	 side	 (Haiyun,	
2023).	 Third,	 China	 has	 adopted	 a	more	
flexible	 interpretation	 of	 the	 non-
interference	 principle	 by	 supporting	
peaceful	 conflict	 resolution	 through	

negotiations	and	discussions	between	the	
disputing	parties.	They	prefer	to	manage	
crises	 through	 UN	 agencies	 and	 let	
regional	 bodies	 such	 as	 the	 GCC	 handle	
them	 without	 interference	 or	 outside	
interference	(Rad,	2023).	

Fourth,	 China	 upholds	 the	
principle	 of	 equality	 and	mutual	 benefit	
for	 both	 parties	 involved	 in	 the	 conflict,	
while	 Iran	 and	 Saudi	 Arabia	 effectively	
construct	energy	fields	and	infrastructure	
development	 projects	 within	 their	
economic	 relationships.	 Cooperation	 in	
the	energy	field	between	China,	Iran,	and	
Saudi	 Arabia	 ensures	 a	 stable	 energy	
supply	 for	China	and	sustainable	 income	
for	 the	 two	Middle	Eastern	 countries.	 In	
addition,	 infrastructure	 projects	 funded	
by	 China	 help	 improve	 regional	
connectivity	 and	 economic	 development	
without	taking	sides	in	regional	conflicts.	
This	 approach	 not	 only	 promotes	
economic	stability	but	also	contributes	to	
long-term	 peace	 and	 prosperity	 in	 the	
region	(Zavareh	&	Fallahi	Barzoki,	2018).	

Fifthly,	 China	 is	 pursuing	 a	
peaceful	 coexistence	 approach	 by	
mediating	a	peace	treaty	between	the	two	
countries,	in	which	the	two	leaders	agreed	
to	 reopen	 their	 embassies	 and	 respect	
each	 country's	 sovereignty.	 China's	 role	
tends	 to	 be	 quasi-mediation	 or	 semi-
mediation,	 promoting	 conflict	 de-
escalation	 without	 fully	 leading	 the	
settlement	process.	Then	China	submitted	
a	five-point	plan	for	regional	security	that	
included	confidence-building	measures	in	
the	Persian	Gulf	as	well	as	easing	tensions	
through	 negotiations	 and	 political	
dialogue	(Burton,	2023).	

This	 mediation	 highlights	 China’s	
ability	 to	 leverage	 its	 economic	
relationships	 and	 political	 influence	 to	
promote	peace.	China's	neutral	stance	and	
emphasis	on	dialogue	have	allowed	 it	 to	
act	 as	 an	 effective	 mediator,	 fostering	 a	
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conducive	environment	for	reconciliation	
between	Saudi	Arabia	and	Iran.	This	role	
underscores	 China's	 capacity	 to	
contribute	 to	 regional	 stability	 and	 its	
growing	influence	as	a	peacebroker	in	the	
Middle	 East	 (Stimson,	 2023;	 VOA	 News,	
2023).	 The	 success	 of	 these	 mediation	
efforts	 illustrates	 China's	 potential	 to	
shape	 diplomatic	 outcomes	 in	 complex	
geopolitical	 landscapes,	 reinforcing	 its	
image	as	a	responsible	global	actor.	

		
Economic	 Cooperation:	 The	 Belt	 and	
Road	Initiative	(BRI)	

The	Belt	and	Road	Initiative	(BRI)	
represents	 a	 cornerstone	 of	 China’s	
peacebuilding	 strategy,	 emphasizing	
economic	 development	 as	 a	 foundation	
for	 stability.	 Through	 infrastructure	
projects	 and	 economic	 partnerships,	
China	aims	to	promote	development	and	
reduce	 conflict.	 The	 BRI’s	 impact	 in	
regions	 like	 Africa	 and	 the	 Middle	 East	
underscores	 the	 effectiveness	 of	
economic	 cooperation	 in	 fostering	peace	
(Legarda,	 2018).	 China's	 economic	
commitment	to	mediating	the	Iran-Saudi-
Arab	conflict	aligns	with	the	goals	of	 the	
Belt	 and	 Road	 Initiative	 (BRI)	 in	 the	
Middle	East	(Khan	et	al.,	2018).	

First,	 China	 sees	 the	 BRI	 as	 a	
strategic	 tool	 for	 mediating	 and	
alleviating	 tensions	 between	 two	
conflicting	 countries	 by	 offering	
infrastructure	 projects	 and	 economic	
cooperation	 that	 can	 benefit	 Iran	 and	
Saudi	 Arabia.	 The	 BRI-backed	
construction	 project	 could	 also	 improve	
diplomatic	and	economic	ties	between	the	
two	countries,	as	well	as	those	with	China.	
Thus,	 BRI	 is	 not	 only	 a	 tool	 for	 China's	
economic	development	but	can	also	be	a	
catalyst	 for	peacebuilding.	Second,	China	
wants	to	boost	the	Xinjiang	economy	(the	
western	mainland	of	China)	by	connecting	
Xinjiang	 to	 Central	 Asia	 and	 the	 Middle	

East	through	new	infrastructure,	which	it	
believes	 can	 help	 reduce	 social	 tension	
and	conflict	in	the	region	and	create	new	
economic	 opportunities	 for	 both	
countries.	

	Third,	 China	 is	 focusing	 on	
building	 symmetrical	 relations	 with	 its	
neighbors	 in	 an	 effort	 to	 create	 a	 stable	
regional	 environment	 to	 support	 its	
sustainable	 economic	 growth.	 This	
approach	can	have	a	significant	impact	on	
the	 conflict	 between	 Iran	 and	 Saudi	
Arabia.	 China	 strives	 to	 build	 friendship	
rather	 than	 hostility	 with	 its	 neighbors,	
which	 is	 critical	 in	 light	 of	 the	
geographical	 complexity	 and	 historical,	
cultural,	economic,	political,	and	security	
situation	around	it.	China	hopes	to	shape	
sustainable	 economic	 development	
through	 the	 BRI,	 which	 can	 not	 only	
strengthen	 domestic	 economic	 stability	
but	 also	 contribute	 to	 the	 mitigation	 of	
regional	 conflicts	 such	as	 Iran	and	Saudi	
Arabia	(Utama,	2024).	

Fourth,	 through	 BRI,	 China	 can	
enhance	 international	 confidence	 by	
fostering	 mutual	 respect	 and	 shared	
interests	 for	 global	 governance	 with	 a	
win-win	approach	 in	politics,	economics,	
and	 religion.	 Fifth,	 by	 addressing	 the	
conflict	 between	 Saudi	 Arabia	 and	 Iran,	
China	 aims	 to	 maintain	 stability	 in	 its	
primary	 energy	 sources	 and	 protect	 its	
interests	in	crude	oil	and	natural	gas.	This	
approach	positions	China's	presence	as	a	
catalyst	for	sustainable	economic	growth,	
as	 it	 fosters	 a	 global	 network	 of	
connectivity	 and	 cooperation.	 Later,	 the	
BRI	aligned	itself	with	China's	diplomatic	
principles	 of	 peaceful	 and	 mutually	
beneficial	 cooperation	 and	 its	
globalization	 approach	 that	 prioritizes	
equality,	economic	growth,	and	social	and	
cultural	respect.	

So	far,	data	from	the	International	
Institute	for	Strategic	Studies	(IISS)	show	
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that	 China's	 investments	 in	 the	 Middle	
East	 have	 reached	 266	 projects	 in	 the	
period	 2005	 to	 2022	 (Chaziza,	 2023).	
China	 is	 also	 a	major	 customer	 of	 Saudi	
Arabia's	 oil	 and	 natural	 gas	 company	
Aramco.	Saudi	Arabia's	public	investment	
fund	received	Aramco's	enormous	profits,	
which	 reached	 billions	 of	 dollars,	 and	
allocated	them	to	the	new	Saudi	economy,	
including	 investments	 in	 an	
environmentally	 friendly	 transition	
through	 the	purchase	of	Chinese	electric	
vehicles	 (Wun-kong	 &	 Wong,	 2024).	
Similarly,	 Saudi	 Arabia	 received	 $5.5	
billion	 in	 investments	 and	 contracts	
through	BRI	by	2022	 (Godement,	2023).	
In	 2013,	 140	 Chinese	 companies	 also	
signed	 contracts	 worth	 $18	 billion	 in	
Saudi	 Arabia's	 construction,	
infrastructure,	 telecommunications,	 and	
petrochemical	sectors	(Dorsey,	2017).	

Similarly,	 economic	 relations	
between	 China	 and	 Iran	 have	 grown	
closer	over	the	past	four	decades.	In	2022,	
China's	import	volume	from	Iran	reached	
$15.798	 billion,	 an	 increase	 of	 $1.035	
billion	 from	 2021.	 Meanwhile,	 China's	
export	volume	to	Iran	continued	to	rise	by	
14%,	reaching	$9.44	billion	compared	to	
$8.258	billion	in	2021.	Furthermore,	 last	
May,	 Iran's	 oil	 exports	 surged	 to	
approximately	1	million	barrels	per	day,	
surpassing	1.5	million	barrels,	with	China	
receiving	 the	majority	 of	 the	 production	
(Smith	&	Paola,	2024).	China	also	invested	
$618	million	in	projects	in	Iran	from	2018	
to	 2022,	 primarily	 in	 the	 construction	
sector	(Shokri,	2023).	

Therefore,	 by	 investing	 in	
infrastructure	and	development	projects,	
China	 seeks	 to	 create	 economic	
interdependence	 and	 mutual	 benefits,	
thereby	 reducing	 the	 likelihood	 of	
conflict.	This	approach	aligns	with	China's	
principle	 of	mutual	 benefit	 and	 peaceful	
coexistence,	 illustrating	 how	 economic	

initiatives	 can	 serve	 as	 tools	 for	
peacebuilding	 (Marks,	 2024).	 The	 BRI	
demonstrates	 China's	 belief	 that	
economic	stability	 is	essential	 for	 lasting	
peace,	 and	 its	 investments	 aim	 to	 build	
the	 foundational	 economic	 conditions	
necessary	to	prevent	conflict	(Khan	et	al.,	
2018).	
	
Contrasting	Perspective	on	Peace	

The	 liberal	 peace	 model	 and	
China’s	 approach	 to	 peacebuilding	
represent	 two	 distinct	 paradigms.	 The	
liberal	 peace	 model	 focuses	 on	
democratic	 values,	 human	 rights,	 and	
economic	 liberalization.	 It	often	 involves	
coercive	 methods,	 such	 as	 military	
intervention	 and	 economic	 sanctions,	 to	
promote	 liberal	 norms.	 Western	
countries,	particularly	those	in	the	United	
States	 and	 Western	 Europe,	 widely	
employ	 this	 approach.	 Economic	
liberalization,	 for	 example,	 involves	
opening	 up	 markets,	 reducing	 trade	
barriers,	 and	 promoting	 foreign	
investment.	The	objective	 is	 to	create	an	
interconnected	global	economy,	enabling	
free	 trade	 to	 enhance	 the	 economic	
prosperity	 of	 all	 participating	 nations	
(Miklian,	2014).	

Human	 rights	 are	 also	 an	
important	 component	 of	 the	 liberal	
approach	to	peace.	This	approach	focuses	
on	 protecting	 the	 fundamental	 rights	 of	
every	individual,	such	as	the	right	to	life,	
freedom,	and	security,	and	recognizes	the	
importance	 of	 economic,	 social,	 and	
cultural	 rights.	 Through	 international	
diplomacy,	 development	 aid,	 and	
humanitarian	 intervention,	 the	countries	
that	 implement	 this	 strategy	 actively	
support	 human	 rights.	 Then,	 democratic	
values,	 widely	 regarded	 as	 the	 most	
effective	 system	 for	 liberal	 peace,	
guarantee	 fair	 and	 representative	
governance,	 thereby	 ensuring	 individual	
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rights	 and	 enhancing	 citizens'	
participation	 in	 political	 processes	 (Avi-
Guy,	2021).	

This	approach	has	been	criticized	
for	imposing	external	political	models	and	
disregarding	 local	 contexts	 for	 using	
coercive	methods.	The	imposition	of	these	
values	 can	 sometimes	 lead	 to	 resistance	
and	 instability,	 as	 local	 dynamics	 and	
cultural	 contexts	 are	 often	 overlooked	
(Visoka	&	Richmond,	2016).	First,	military	
interventions,	such	as	the	US	 invasion	of	
Iraq	 in	 2003,	 are	 based	on	 the	 idea	 that	
dismissing	 Saddam	 Hussein's	 regime	
would	 bring	 democracy	 to	 the	 Middle	
East.	 However,	 the	 outcome	 of	 these	
interventions	is	heavily	controversial,	and	
many	believe	that	they	fail	to	achieve	the	
goal	 of	 democratization	 and	 increase	
instability	in	the	region.	

Second,	 countries	 that	 breach	
international	 law	 or	 human	 rights	
frequently	 face	 economic	 sanctions.	 For	
example,	the	aim	of	imposing	sanctions	on	
Iran	 and	 North	 Korea	 is	 to	 encourage	
them	to	change	their	nuclear	policies	and	
respect	human	rights.	 (Dyachkov,	2018).	
Despite	 their	 intention	 to	 bring	 about	
change,	 these	 sanctions	 frequently	
exacerbate	the	situation	for	civilians	and	
deteriorate	 economic	 and	 humanitarian	
conditions	 without	 yielding	 significant	
policy	changes.	

	Then,	 the	 conditionality	 of	 aid	
perpetuates	 liberal	peace,	 as	 institutions	
such	as	the	International	Monetary	Fund	
(IMF)	and	the	World	Bank	impose	certain	
conditions	for	economic	aid.	The	recipient	
countries	 must	 implement	 neoliberal	
economic	 reforms,	 such	 as	 privatization,	
deregulation,	 and	 subsidy	 cuts.	 Because	
this	 policy	 can	 exacerbate	 economic	
inequalities	 and	 reduce	 government	
control	 over	 national	 economies,	
recipient	 countries	 are	 frequently	
dissatisfied	with	it.	

The	coercive	impact	of	promoting	
liberal	 peace	 also	 affects	 societies	 by	
compelling	 them	 to	 embrace	 foreign	
values,	potentially	leading	to	political	and	
social	 instability.	 For	 example,	 many	
countries	 in	 the	 Middle	 East	 and	 Africa	
face	 strong	 resistance	 to	 liberalization	
agendas	imposed	from	outside.	Economic	
sanctions	 and	 aid	 conditionality	 often	
have	 a	 negative	 impact	 on	 target	
countries'	 economies	 and	 social	 well-
being.	For	example,	sanctions	imposed	on	
Zimbabwe	in	the	early	2000s	led	to	severe	
economic	decline,	with	high	inflation	and	
increased	poverty.	People	often	view	the	
use	of	coercive	methods	as	a	violation	of	
national	 sovereignty.	 The	 countries	
targeted	feel	that	they	lose	control	of	their	
domestic	policies,	which	can	arouse	anti-
Western	 sentiment	 and	 strengthen	 the	
nationalist	narrative	(Visoka	&	Richmond,	
2016).	

In	 contrast,	 China’s	 approach	 is	
rooted	 in	 the	 Five	 Principles	 of	 Peaceful	
Coexistence,	 advocating	 for	 peaceful	
coexistence	 without	 imposing	 external	
political	 models.	 China	 prioritizes	
stability	 through	 economic	 development	
and	 cooperation,	 respecting	 the	
sovereignty	 of	 nations.	 This	 method	
emphasizes	 non-interference,	 mutual	
respect,	 and	 mutually	 beneficial	
partnerships,	 offering	 an	 alternative	
framework	for	achieving	global	peace	and	
stability.	China’s	approach	seeks	to	build	
peace	 through	 respect	 for	 national	
sovereignty	 and	 economic	 collaboration,	
presenting	 a	 non-coercive	 model	 that	
respects	 local	 contexts	 and	 prioritizes	
long-term	stability	 through	development	
(Miklian,	 2014).	 This	 contrast	 highlights	
the	 philosophical	 and	 practical	
differences	between	the	two	models,	each	
with	 its	 unique	 strengths	 and	 potential	
drawbacks.	
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	China	presents	itself	as	a	country	
whose	minds	evolve	with	the	goal	of	living	
side	 by	 side,	 creating	 a	 new	 economic	
world	 order,	 and	 rejecting	 an	 alliance.	
China	 aims	 to	 revise	 the	 international	
order	 by	 emphasizing	 negotiation,	
compromise,	 and	 policy	 coordination	 in	
conflict	 management	 efforts;	 enhancing	
the	 regional	 and	 functional	 role	 of	 the	
United	 Nations	 security	 management	
institutions;	and	maintaining	the	status	of	
absolute	 sovereignty	 and	 non-
interference	in	the	internal	affairs	of	other	
countries	 (How,	2023).	 China's	principle	
of	 living	side	by	side	peacefully	does	not	
require	widespread	cooperation	based	on	
common	 values.	 To	 prevent	 the	 use	 of	
interstate	 force	with	 conflicting	 national	
interests,	China	emphasizes	the	pursuit	of	
national	 interests	 based	 on	 the	 five	
principles	 of	 peaceful	 coexistence,	 a	
combination	 of	 individual	 foreign	 policy	
and	extensive	international	dialogue.	

	
	Table	1.	Differences	Between	the	US	and	

China	Approaches	to	Peacebuilding	

Source:	Author’s	Analysis,	2025	
	

	Table	1	above	 reveals	 that	 liberal	
Black	 countries	 such	 as	 the	 US	 tend	 to	
establish	 cooperation	 based	 on	 liberal	
values	 and	 shared	 interests,	 aiming	 for	
shared	 political,	 economic,	 and	 human	
rights	 perspectives,	 whereas	 China	
prioritizes	coexisting	countries.	They	seek	

to	 expand	 their	 influence	 through	 active	
participation	 in	 international	
organizations,	 with	 an	 emphasis	 on	
regional	 and	 global	 cooperation.	 Later,	
the	US	took	advantage	of	alliance	systems	
such	as	NATO	and	SEATO,	which	provided	
collective	 security	 and	 strengthened	 the	
US	 position	 on	 the	 international	 stage.	
Unlike	 China,	 which	 relies	 on	 the	 UN	
system	 as	 an	 institutional	 base,	 they	
support	 the	 UN's	 role	 in	 conflict	
resolution,	 humanitarian	 aid,	 and	
sustainable	 development.	 China	 is	 also	
active	in	UN	organizations	such	as	UNDP	
and	UNICEF.		

China	has	succeeded	in	playing	an	
important	 role	 as	 a	 mediator	 in	 the	
conflict	between	Iran	and	Saudi	Arabia	by	
demonstrating	 its	 impartiality	 towards	
the	 two	 countries	 in	 line	 with	 China's	
principles	of	peaceful	coexistence,	which	
has	managed	to	create	peace	in	the	region.	
China's	neutral	 role	 allows	both	 sides	 to	
feel	 more	 comfortable	 and	 open	 in	 the	
mediation	 process,	 which	 ultimately	
contributes	 to	 the	 achievement	 of	
agreements	and	conflict	resolution.	China	
has	 successfully	 upheld	 its	 unilateral	
foreign	 policy,	 thereby	 earning	 the	
acceptance	of	Iran	and	Saudi	Arabia	as	a	
just	 mediator	 (Yazdani,	 2023).	 This	
approach	 reflects	 Chinese	 principles	 in	
peacebuilding	that	emphasize	respect	and	
non-interference	with	 the	sovereignty	of	
other	countries.	

China	 emphasizes	 that	 the	 best	
way	 to	 resolve	 the	 conflict	 is	 through	
discussion	 and	 diplomacy,	 which	 will	
ultimately	 create	 stability	 and	 peace	 in	
the	 Middle	 East	 region.	 China’s	 foreign	
policy,	 which	 focuses	 on	 economic	
cooperation	 and	 infrastructure	
development,	as	demonstrated	by	the	Belt	
and	 Road	 Initiative	 (BRI),	 also	 boosts	
confidence	and	relations	with	countries	in	
the	Near	East	(Garlick	&	Havlová,	2020).	

Factors	 United	
States	

China	

International	
Objective	
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basis	
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(common	
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countries	
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interest)	

International	
relations	
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Unlike	China,	 the	US	and	Western	
countries	 appear	 to	 be	 less	 effective	
mediators	 in	 the	 Middle	 East	 regional	
conflict.	 Trita	 Parsi,	 the	 executive	 vice	
president	of	 the	Quincy	Institute,	asserts	
that	US	policies	frequently	lack	neutrality	
and	 instead	 intensify	 conflict	 situations.	
For	 example,	 it	 is	 difficult	 for	 the	 US	 to	
serve	as	a	respected	mediator	because	it	
is	 often	 directly	 involved	 in	 regional	
conflicts	 such	 as	 the	 conflict	 between	
Israel	and	Iran.	US	involvement	in	various	
regional	conflicts	shows	its	tendency	to	be	
on	 the	 side	 of	 a	 particular	 party,	 which	
reduces	 its	 credibility	 as	 a	 mediator	
(Gadzo,	2023).	

This	 approach	 differs	 from	 the	
Chinese	approach,	which	aims	to	maintain	
neutrality	 and	 non-partisanship.	 For	
example,	 the	military	 involvement	of	 the	
US	 in	 the	Middle	 East,	 whether	 through	
direct	 warfare	 or	 providing	 military	
support	to	certain	countries,	has	led	many	
to	 doubt	 its	 ability	 to	 act	 as	 a	 fair	
mediator.	 Moreover,	 the	 Middle	 East	
countries	 hold	 little	 faith	 in	 the	 US's	
foreign	 policy,	 which	 is	 often	
interventionist	and	aims	to	 influence	the	
internal	 politics	 of	 other	 countries,	 as	
demonstrated	 in	 the	 cases	 of	 Iraq	 and	
Syria.	These	countries	see	the	US	as	more	
interested	 in	 its	 own	 strategic	 and	
economic	 interests	 than	 in	 promoting	
peace	 and	 stability	 in	 their	 own	
territories.	

Over	 the	 past	 decade,	 China’s	
increasing	engagement	in	regional	peace-
building	reflects	its	strategic	commitment	
to	 balancing	 peace	 and	 economic	
development.	This	involvement	signifies	a	
deliberate	 transformation	 of	 China’s	
international	 posture—from	 a	
predominantly	 economic	 power	 to	 a	
responsible	 global	 actor	 that	 actively	
contributes	 to	 conflict	 resolution	 and	
international	 stability.	 China’s	 role	

extends	 beyond	 that	 of	 a	 conventional	
facilitator,	 mediator,	 or	 provider	 of	
military	 assistance	 in	 conflict	 zones.	
Rather,	 it	 has	 taken	 proactive	 measures	
by	 introducing	 key	 conceptual	
frameworks	 such	 as	 the	 Global	 Security	
Initiative	 (GSI),	 the	 Global	 Development	
Initiative	(GDI),	and	the	Global	Civilization	
Initiative	(GCI).	These	initiatives	highlight	
China’s	 intention	 to	 promote	 a	
comprehensive	 and	 sustainable	 peace	
architecture.	

China’s	 aspiration	 to	 become	 a	
peacebuilder	 is	 also	 motivated	 by	 its	
strategic	interest	in	maintaining	regional	
stability	 as	 a	 prerequisite	 for	 the	
continued	 expansion	 of	 its	 global	
economic	 footprint.	 By	 advocating	 for	
principles	 such	 as	 dialogue,	 mutual	
development,	 and	 respect	 for	 national	
sovereignty,	 China	 positions	 itself	 as	 a	
proponent	 of	 an	 alternative	 model	 of	
conflict	resolution,	distinct	from	Western	
liberal	 peace	 paradigms.	 While	 critics	
argue	that	China’s	peace	initiatives	serve	
to	 expand	 its	 political	 influence	 and	
military	presence,	it	is	crucial	to	note	that	
the	 available	 evidence	 does	 not	 indicate	
that	China	imposes	political	conditions	or	
obligations	 on	 states	 involved	 in	 its	
mediation	 processes.	 Consequently,	
China’s	 peace-building	 efforts	 appear	 to	
be	 primarily	 aimed	 at	 safeguarding	 its	
long-term	 economic	 interests	 while	
simultaneously	cultivating	 its	 image	as	a	
constructive	and	responsible	actor	in	the	
global	order.	

		
Conclusion	

China's	 alternative	 approach	 to	
global	conflict	resolution,	grounded	in	the	
Five	 Principles	 of	 Peaceful	 Coexistence,	
presents	a	significant	departure	from	the	
liberal	 peace	 paradigm.	 By	 emphasizing	
non-interference,	 mutual	 respect,	 and	
economic	 cooperation,	 China	 offers	 a	
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model	 that	 challenges	 the	 dominance	 of	
liberal	 peacebuilding	 norms.	 This	
approach	has	 implications	 for	 the	 global	
order,	 suggesting	 a	 multipolar	 world	
where	 diverse	 peacebuilding	 strategies	
coexist.	The	study	concludes	that	China's	
role	 in	 global	 peacebuilding	 is	 evolving,	
and	 its	 strategies	 offer	 valuable	 insights	
into	alternative	paths	to	achieving	global	
peace	 and	 stability.	 China	 has	 increased	
its	 participation	 in	 UN	 Peacekeeping	
Operations,	 demonstrating	 a	 strong	
commitment	 to	 global	 stability.	
Additionally,	China's	role	as	a	mediator	in	
the	Saudi-Iran	conflict	reflects	its	respect	
for	 sovereignty	 and	 non-intervention,	
emphasizing	 dialogue	 and	 economic	
cooperation.	 Through	 the	 Belt	 and	Road	
Initiative	(BRI),	China	promotes	economic	
development	 as	 the	 foundation	 for	 long-
term	peace.	This	approach	contrasts	with	
the	 Western	 liberal	 peace	 paradigm,	
which	 often	 employs	 coercive	 methods.	
Instead,	 China	 shows	 the	 potential	 for	 a	
multipolar	 world	 with	 various	 peace	
models.	

Further	 research	 is	 needed	 to	
understand	 the	 long-term	 impact	 of	
China's	 approach	 on	 international	 peace	
and	 security	 dynamics.	 This	 research	
provides	crucial	insights	into	how	China's	
peace-building	 strategies	 may	 influence	
global	 conflict	 resolution	 and	 the	
international	 order	 in	 the	 future.	 China	
emphasizes	 cooperation	 and	
development	 over	Western	 liberalism	 in	
global	 conflict	 resolution,	 reshaping	
dynamics	 significantly.	 While	 offering	
promising	 alternatives,	 this	 approach	
raises	 concerns	 regarding	 transparency	
and	 human	 rights.	 Therefore,	 careful	
analysis	 is	 needed	 to	 manage	 both	 the	
positive	impacts	and	risks	associated	with	
China's	role	in	international	security.	
	
	

Acknowledgement	
The	Authors	would	 like	 to	extend	

the	 gratitude	 towards	 everyone	 who	
support.	
	
References	
Adhikari,	 M.	 (2021).	 Peacebuilding	 with	

“Chinese	 Characteristics”?	 Insights	
from	 China’s	 Engagement	 in	
Myanmar’s	 Peace	 Process.	
International	 Studies	 Review,	 23(4),	
1699–1726.	
https://doi.org/10.1093/isr/viab03
9	

Arrey,	L.	E.	 (2023,	May	28).	China’s	Push	
for	 Normative	 Change	 in	 UN	
Peacekeeping.	Institute	for	Security	&	
Development	 Policy.	
https://www.isdp.eu/un-
peacekeeping-china-pushing-for-
normative-changes/	

Avi-Guy,	 O.	 (2021).	 Transformation	 –	
Overcoming	 the	 Limits	 of	 Liberal	
Peace	 and	 Transitional	 Justice	 in	
Deeply	 Divided	 Societies:	
Reconciliation	 in	 Liberal	 Peace	
Theory.	 Israel	 Law	 Review,	 54(3),	
289–304.	
https://doi.org/10.1017/S0021223
721000169	

Braun,	 V.,	 &	 Clarke,	 V.	 (2006).	 Using	
thematic	 analysis	 in	 psychology.	
Taylor	 and	 Francis,	 3(2),	 77–101.	
https://doi.org/10.1191/14780887
06qp063oa	

Burton,	 G.	 (2023,	 March	 15).	What	 the	
Iran-Saudi	 Agreement	 Reveals	 About	
China’s	 Approach	 to	 Conflict	
Management.	 The	 Diplomat.	
https://thediplomat.com/2023/03/
what-the-iran-saudi-agreement-
reveals-about-chinas-approach-to-
conflict-management/	

Chaziza,	 M.	 (2023,	 June	 4).	 A	 Decade	 of	
China’s	Belt	and	Road	Initiative	in	the	
Middle	 East.	 The	 National	 Interest.	



I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I 
I I I I I I 

Journal	of	Governance	Volume	10,	Issue	2,	June	2025	

 346 

https://nationalinterest.org/feature
/decade-china%E2%80%99s-belt-
and-road-initiative-middle-east-
206525	

Chen,	 J.,	 Yang,	 X.,	 Wang,	 M.,	 &	 Su,	 M.	
(2023).	 Evolution	 of	 China’s	
interaction	 with	 Middle	 Eastern	
countries	 under	 the	 Belt	 and	 Road	
Initiative.	 PLoS	 ONE,	 18(11	
November).	
https://doi.org/10.1371/journal.po
ne.0293426	

Dorsey,	J.	M.	(2017).	China	and	the	Middle	
East:	 Venturing	 into	 the	Maelstrom.	
Asian	 Journal	 of	 Middle	 Eastern	 and	
Islamic	 Studies,	 11(1),	 1–14.	
https://doi.org/10.1080/25765949.
2017.12023322	

Dyachkov,	 I.	 V.	 (2018).	 Un	 Sanctions	
Against	The	DPRK:	An	Assesment	Of	
Efficiency.	Tambov	University	Review.	
Series:	 Humanities,	 177,	 173–179.	
https://doi.org/10.20310/1810-
0201-2018-23-177-173-179	

Gadzo,	M.	(2023).	‘Changing	global	order’:	
China’s	 hand	 in	 the	 Iran-Saudi	 deal.	
Aljazeera.Com.	
https://www.aljazeera.com/news/2
023/3/11/changing-global-order-
china-restores-ties-with-iran-and-
saudi	

Garlick,	 J.,	 &	 Havlová,	 R.	 (2020).	 China’s	
“Belt	and	Road”	Economic	Diplomacy	
in	the	Persian	Gulf:	Strategic	Hedging	
amidst	 Saudi–Iranian	 Regional	
Rivalry.	 Journal	 of	 Current	 Chinese	
Affairs,	 49(1),	 82–105.	
https://doi.org/10.1177/18681026
19898706	

gill,	 bates,	 &	 huang,	 chin-hao.	 (2009).	
CHINA’S	EXPANDING	PEACEKEEPING	
ROLE:	 ITS	 SIGNIFICANCE	 AND	 THE	
POLICY	 IMPLICATIONS	 SIPRI	 Policy	
Brief.	http://www.un.	

Godement,	 F.	 (2023,	 July	 20).	 China’s	
Diplomatic	 Coup	 in	 the	 Middle	 East:	

The	 Facts	 Behind	 the	 Hype.	 The	
Diplomat.	
https://thediplomat.com/2023/07/
chinas-diplomatic-coup-in-the-
middle-east-the-facts-behind-the-
hype/	

Haiyun,	M.	(2023,	April	14).	China’s	Saudi-
Iran	deal	only	a	defensive	response	to	
Western	 security	 challenges.	 Think	
China.	
https://www.thinkchina.sg/politics
/chinas-saudi-iran-deal-only-
defensive-response-western-
security-challenges	

How,	 J.	 Z.	 (2023).	 Public	 relations,	
persona-building,	 and	 national	
identity	 construction	 in	 China.	 In	
Public	 relations,	 persona-building,	
and	national	 identity	 construction	 in	
China	 (1st	 ed.,	 pp.	 56–71).	
https://doi.org/10.4324/97810033
99124-5	

Jiali,	 M.	 A.,	 &	 Thakur,	 R.	 (2004).	 BASIC	
NORMS	 OF	 CONTEMPORARY	
INTERNATIONAL	RELATIONS.	World	
Affairs:	 The	 Journal	 of	 International	
Issues,	 8(4),	 30–34.	
https://www.jstor.org/stable/4850
4903	

Khan,	M.	K.,	 Sandano,	 I.	A.,	Pratt,	C.	B.,	&	
Farid,	 T.	 (2018).	 China’s	 Belt	 and	
Road	Initiative:	A	global	model	for	an	
evolving	 approach	 to	 sustainable	
regional	development.	Sustainability	
(Switzerland),	 10(11).	
https://doi.org/10.3390/su101142
34	

Kuo,	 S.	 C.	 Y.	 (2015).	 Chinese	 Peace?	 An	
Emergent	 Norm	 in	 African	 Peace	
Operations.	 China	 Quarterly	 of	
International	 Strategic	 Studies,	
01(01),	 155–181.	
https://doi.org/10.1142/S2377740
015500086	

Kuo,	 S.	 C.	 Y.	 (2020,	 January	 27).	 China’s	
approach	 to	 peace	 in	 Africa	 is	



I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I 
I I I 

Fitriandi	&	Al	Fadhat,	From	Liberal	Peace	to	Mutual	Coexistence:	China’s	Approach	to	Global	
Conflict	Resolution	

     347 

different.	 How	 and	 why.	 The	
Diplomat.	

Legarda,	H.	(2018,	August	22).	China	as	a	
conflict	 mediator:	 maintaining	
stability	 along	 the	 Belt	 and	 Road.	
International	 Institute	 for	 Strategic	
Studies.	

Lei,	 Z.	 (2011).	 Two	 Pillars	 of	 China’s	
Global	 Peace	 Engagement	 Strategy:	
UN	 Peacekeeping	 and	 International	
Peacebuilding.	 International	
Peacekeeping,	 18(3),	 344–362.	
https://doi.org/10.1080/13533312.
2011.563107	

Lyall,	N.,	Al-Barasneh,	A.,	&	Abu	Dalbouh,	
W.	 (2023).	 China’s	 changing	
engagement	in	global	peace	building	
and	 conflict	 resolution:	 drivers	 and	
trends.	Jordanian	Journal	of	Law	and	
Political	 Science,	 14(4).	
https://doi.org/10.35682/jjlps.v14i
4.352	

Marks,	J.	(2024,	May	10).	China’s	Strategic	
Facilitation	 in	 the	 Persian	 Gulf	
Security	 Crisis.	 Stimson.	
https://www.stimson.org/2024/chi
nas-strategic-facilitation-in-the-
persian-gulf-security-crisis/	

Menegazzi,	 S.	 (2012).	 China	 Reinterprets	
the	 Liberal	 Peace.	
http://www.guardian.co.uk/comme
ntisfree/2012/sep/28/bo-xilai-trial-
not-without-risks.	

Miklian,	 J.	 (2014).	The	Past,	 Present	 and	
Future	 of	 the	 ‘Liberal	 Peace.’	
Strategic	 Analysis,	 38(4),	 493–507.	
https://doi.org/10.1080/09700161.
2014.918426	

Ministry	of	Foreign	Affairs	of	the	People’s	
Republic	 of	 China.	 (2014,	 July).	The	
Five	 Principles	 of	 Peaceful	 Co-
Existence	 Stand	 Stronger.	 Ir.China-
Embassy.Gov.Cn.	 http://ir.china-
embassy.gov.cn/eng/dtxw/201407/
t20140702_1894012.htm	

Popovic,	S.,	&	Stevic,	L.	(2021).	Going	Blue	
From	Red	–	Chinese	Engagement	 In	
The	 UN	 Peacekeeping	 Operations.	
Politička	 Revija,	 69(3/2021),	 173–
195.	
https://doi.org/10.22182/pr.69320
21.8	

Qayum,	H.,	Jalal,	S.	U.,	&	Ishfaq,	U.	(2018).	
CHINAS	 GROWING	 STRATEGIC	
INTERESTS	 IN	 AFGHANISTAN.	
Global	Political	Review,	3(1),	94–100.	
https://doi.org/10.31703/gpr.2018
(iii-i).10	

Rad,	 A.	 M.	 (2023,	 August	 3).	 Towards	
Iranian-Saudi	 Détente:	 China	 as	 a	
Mediator	in	the	Middle	East?	London	
School	 of	 Economics	 and	 Political	
Science.	
https://blogs.lse.ac.uk/cff/2023/08
/03/towards-iranian-saudi-detente-
china-as-a-mediator-in-the-middle-
east/	

Shokri,	U.	 (2023,	 June	23).	Obstacles	and	
opportunities	 for	 closer	 Iranian-
Chinese	 economic	 cooperation.	
Middle	 East	 Institute.	
https://www.mei.edu/publications/
obstacles-and-opportunities-closer-
iranian-chinese-economic-
cooperation	

Smith,	G.,	&	Paola,	A.	Di.	(2024,	June	16).	
Iranian	Oil	Is	Quietly	Flooding	Into	the	
Global	 Market	 Again.	 Boomberg.	
https://www.bloomberg.com/news
/articles/2023-06-16/iranian-oil-is-
quietly-flooding-into-the-global-
market-again	

Stimson.	 (2023,	 March	 13).	 The	 Story	
Behind	China’s	Role	in	the	Iran-Saudi	
Deal.	 Stimson.Org.	
https://www.stimson.org/2023/the
-story-behind-chinas-role-in-the-
iran-saudi-deal/	

The	State	Council	Information	Office	The	
Peoples	 Republic	 of	 China.	 (2020).	
China’s	Armed	Forces:	30	Years	of	UN	



I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I 
I I I I I I 

Journal	of	Governance	Volume	10,	Issue	2,	June	2025	

 348 

Peacekeeping	 Operations.	
http://english.scio.gov.cn/whitepap
ers/2020-
09/18/content_76716768_9.htm	

Theory	China.	 (2021,	April	 26).	The	Five	
Principles	 of	 Peaceful	 Coexistence.	
Theory	 China.	
https://en.theorychina.org.cn/c/20
21-04-26/1387734.shtmla	

United	 Nation	 Peace	 Keeping.	 (2024).	
How	 We	 are	 Funded?	
Peacekeeping.Un.Org.	
https://peacekeeping.un.org/en/ho
w-we-are-funded	

Utama,	 V.	 R.	 (2024,	 June	 13).	Membaca	
Strategi	 China	 di	 Timur	 Tengah.	
Detik.Com.	
https://news.detik.com/kolom/d-
7387424/membaca-strategi-china-
di-timur-tengah	

Visoka,	 G.,	 &	 Richmond,	 O.	 (2016).	 After	
Liberal	 Peace?	 From	 Failed	 State-
Building	to	an	Emancipatory	Peace	in	
Kosovo.	 International	 Studies	
Perspectives,	 ekw006.	
https://doi.org/10.1093/isp/ekw00
6	

Voa	News.	(2023,	March	10).	White	House	
Welcomes	 Chinese-Brokered	 Saudi-
Iran	 Deal.	 Voanews.Com.	
https://voanews.com/a/white-
house-welcomes-chinese-brokered-
saudi-iran-deal/6999700.html	

Wong,	 K.	 C.	 (2021).	 The	 Rise	 of	 China’s	
Developmental	 Peace:	 Can	 an	
Economic	Approach	to	Peacebuilding	
Create	 Sustainable	 Peace?	 Global	
Society,	 35(4),	 522–540.	
https://doi.org/10.1080/13600826.
2021.1942802	

Wun-kong,	L.,	&	Wong,	K.	T.	 (2024,	 June	
10).	Stronger	China-Saudi	Arabia	Ties	
Benefit	 the	Entire	Middle	East.	China	
Daily.	
https://www.chinadailyhk.com/hk/
article/585308	

Xinhua.	 (2020,	 September	 12).	 China’s	
Armed	 Forces:	 30	 Years	 of	 UN	
Peacekeeping	Operations.	Xinhua.Net.	
China’s	 Armed	 Forces:	 30	 Years	 of	
UN	Peacekeeping	Operations	

Yazdani,	E.	(2023).	Journal	of	Humanities	
and	 Social	 Sciences	 Studies	 Iran’s	
Relations	 with	 China	 under	 the	
Influence	 of	 Two	 Regional	 Events.	
https://doi.org/10.32996/jhsss	

Yin,	 R.	 K.	 (2018).	 Case	 Study	 Research	
Design	 and	 Methods	 (5th	 ed.).	 Sage	
Publications.	

Yuan,	 X.	 (2020).	 Chinese	 pathways	 to	
peacebuilding:	 from	 historical	
legacies	 to	 contemporary	 practices.	
Pathways	 to	 Peace	 and	 Security,	 1,	
26–45.	
https://doi.org/10.20542/2307-
1494-2020-1-26-45	

Zavareh,	 M.	 S.,	 &	 Fallahi	 Barzoki,	 M.	
(2018).	China’s	Energy	Security:	 I.R.	
Iran	 and	 Saudi	 Arabia’s	 Role	 in	
China’s	 Energy	 Diplomacy.	 In	 Econ.	
Rev	(Vol.	22,	Issue	3).	

Zhang,	 Y.	 (2022).	 China’s	 rise	 and	 peace	
building	 in	 Asia.	 Journal	 of	 Chinese	
Economic	and	Business	Studies,	20(3),	
275–285.	
https://doi.org/10.1080/14765284.
2022.2046439	

	


